
Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

1 POST SIGN
12 FT
CHANNEL

100433 285-80 Street Light Poles
and Standards

300.0000 EA PO Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        472 1 American
Architect
ural
Design

Michael
Hinson

300.0000 10/20/201
3

NO BID

        734 1 McCain
Sales of
Florida,
Inc.

Mary Bender      5455 300.0000 10/20/201
3

29.90000 8,970.00

        956 1 Proforma
PrintSour
ce

Dan Mack      4434 300.0000 10/20/201
3

NO BID

        1550 1 MDSoluti
ons

Neil Louy 300.0000 10/23/201
3

29.94000 8,982.00

        1570 1 Vulcan
Inc.

J. Todd
Koniar

     7759 300.0000 10/20/201
3

29.53000 8,859.00

        3051 1 P-M
TUBE &
SPECIAL
TIES,
INC.

LISA
PHILLIPS-
SMITH

300.0000 10/16/201
3

30.73000 9,219.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

2 POST SIGN
2X2X12 FT
SQUARE

100434 285-80 Street Light Poles
and Standards

250.0000 EA PO Open

Page 1 of 2



Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        472 1 American
Architect
ural
Design

Michael
Hinson

250.0000 10/20/201
3

NO BID

        734 1 McCain
Sales of
Florida,
Inc.

Mary Bender      5455 250.0000 10/20/201
3

24.95000 6,237.50

        956 1 Proforma
PrintSour
ce

Dan Mack      4434 250.0000 10/20/201
3

NO BID

        1550 1 MDSoluti
ons

Neil Louy 250.0000 10/16/201
3

29.67000 7,417.50

        1570 1 Vulcan
Inc.

J. Todd
Koniar

     7759 250.0000 10/20/201
3

28.01000 7,002.50

        3051 1 P-M
TUBE &
SPECIAL
TIES,
INC.

LISA
PHILLIPS-
SMITH

250.0000 10/16/201
3

18.14000 4,535.00
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