
Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

2 SCMPD
Quarterly
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

4.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 4.0000 1958.91000 7,835.64

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 4.0000 4250.00000 17,000.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

4.0000 4425.01000 17,700.04

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 4.0000 1870.00000 7,480.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams NO BID

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 4.0000 19062.00000 76,248.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 4.0000 500.00000 2,000.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

3 SCMPD
Semi-Annual
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

2.0000 EA No Output Open
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 2.0000 2053.02000 4,106.04

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 2.0000 3825.00000 7,650.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

2.0000 1200.00000 2,400.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 2.0000 2100.00000 4,200.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams NO BID

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 2.0000 1720.00000 3,440.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 2.0000 1000.00000 2,000.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

4 SCMPD
Headquarters
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 7011.64000 84,139.68

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 2279.40000 27,352.80
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 6634.00000 79,608.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 3400.00000 40,800.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams NO BID

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 9496.00000 113,952.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 2375.00000 28,500.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

5 SCMPD
Downtown
Precinct
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 708.49000 8,501.88

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 515.00000 6,180.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 658.00000 7,896.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams NO BID

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 591.00000 7,092.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 510.09000 6,121.08

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

6 SCMPD
Central
Precinct
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 630.05000 7,560.60

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 412.00000 4,944.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 633.00000 7,596.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 600.00000 7,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 526.00000 6,312.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 399.04000 4,788.48

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

7 SCMPD
Southside
Precinct
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 867.05000 10,404.60

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 494.40000 5,932.80

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 613.00000 7,356.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 600.00000 7,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 1730.00000 20,760.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 401.02000 4,812.24
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Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

8 SCMPD
T.R.A.P.
Office
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 629.53000 7,554.36

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 566.50000 6,798.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 978.00000 11,736.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 600.00000 7,200.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 830.00000 9,960.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 200.00000 2,400.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

9 SCMPD
Traffic
Office
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 408.53000 4,902.36

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 515.00000 6,180.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 540.00000 6,480.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 250.00000 3,000.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 450.00000 5,400.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 366.00000 4,392.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 525.06000 6,300.72

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

10 SCMPD
Police
Training
Facility
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 289.18000 3,470.16

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 350.00000 4,200.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 200.00000 2,400.00

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 NO BID

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 145.00000 1,740.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 225.09000 2,701.08

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

11 SCMPD
Police
Training
Center
Janitorial
Services

JANITORIAL
SERVICES

910-39 Janitorial/Custodi
al Services

12.0000 EA No Output Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        431 1 Rite Way
Service, Inc.

Ben Weil 12.0000 731.24000 8,774.88

        1043 1 Imagann
Cleaning
Service, Inc.

Martha Wilson      3017 12.0000 618.00000 7,416.00

        1476 1 HillTop
Business
Services Inc

Kathleen
McGinley

12.0000 534.00000 6,408.00

        2422 1 American
Janitorial

Stephen jones 12.0000 300.00000 3,600.00
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performance
Evaluation

Score

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Award
Quantity

        2466 1 Jess Clenz Jessica Williams 12.0000 450.00000 5,400.00

        2532 1 Goodwill
Industries
Coast Emp

Cynthia Barnes 12.0000 578.00000 6,936.00

        2586 1 A & B
Cleaning
Service Inc.

marvin mckesson 12.0000 433.08000 5,196.96
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