

10015-Event 764

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
81	AXE 6 LB	100451	445-03	Axes, Adzes, Bush Hooks, Hatchets, Mattocks, Picks, etc.	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	42.11000	1,010.64	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
82	BLADES DITCH BANK	100454	445-03	Axes, Adzes, Bush Hooks, Hatchets, Mattocks, Picks, etc.	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000	11/07/2012	42.25000	1,014.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	39.00000	936.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
83	BLADES HACKSAW	100455	445-08	Blades, Hand Saw (Non-Powered)	300.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				300.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			300.0000	11/07/2012	1.60000	480.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			300.0000	11/12/2012	11.70000	3,510.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
84	DIGGER POST HOLE	100460	445-55	Posthole Diggers, Earth Augers, etc. (Including Utility Prob	24.0000	PR	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributors	Michelle Stroup				24.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOOD RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000		11/07/2012	29.20000	700.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000		11/12/2012	19.00000	456.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
85	FORK MANURE 6 TINE	100480	445-61	Scoops, Shovels, Spades, Spading Forks, etc. (Including Entr	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	Distributors MILLWOCK RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	DAN T	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	28.75000	345.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	29.70000	356.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
86	FORK ENSILAGE 10 TINE	100481	445-61	Scoops, Shovels, Spades, Spading Forks, etc. (Including Entr	120.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributors	Michelle Stroup				120.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOCK RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	DAN T	3980			120.0000	11/07/2012	72.00000	8,640.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			120.0000	11/12/2012	74.60000	8,952.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
87	GUN GREASE	100482	055-33	Grease Guns, Automotive	40.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				40.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			40.0000		11/07/2012	27.36000	1,094.40	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			40.0000		11/12/2012	29.70000	1,188.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
88	HOSE GREASE GUN	100483	055-33	Grease Guns, Automotive	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	11.78000	70.68	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	12.80000	76.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
89	TIP GREASE GUN	100484	055-33	Grease Guns, Automotive	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	9.75000	58.50	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	10.60000	63.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
90	HAMMER ENGINEER 3 LB	100485	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup			24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO DAN RKS & DAVENPOR SUPPLY T INC	3980			24.0000	11/07/2012	16.40000	393.60	
964	1	Hagemey Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	14.10000	338.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
91	HAMMER BALL PEEN 1 LB	100486	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers	Michelle			6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
		Tire Supply Distribution	Stroup					e 2			
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	12.00000	72.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	18.30000	109.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
92	HAMMER BALL PEEN 1 1/2 LB	100487	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	13.70000	82.20	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	20.80000	124.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
93	HAMMER BRICK 24 OZ	100488	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKES & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	28.40000	340.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	26.40000	316.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
94	HAMMER CLAW 16 OZ	100489	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	36.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				36.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			36.0000	11/07/2012	6.20000	223.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			36.0000	11/12/2012	19.40000	698.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
95	HAMMER SLEDGE 6 LB	100490	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	4.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				4.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			4.0000	11/07/2012	17.55000	70.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			4.0000	11/12/2012	20.30000	81.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
96	HAMMER SLEDGE 10 LB	100491	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	4.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				4.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			4.0000	11/07/2012	22.40000	89.60	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			4.0000	11/12/2012	27.10000	108.40	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
97	HAMMER SLEDGE 16 LB	100492	445-38	Hammers, Mallets, Crow Bars, Pinch Bars, Pry Bars, Ripping B	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKES & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	37.25000	447.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	42.10000	505.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
98	HOE GARDEN	100504	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000		11/07/2012	18.40000	220.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000		11/12/2012	19.00000	228.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
99	HOE MORTAR	100505	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers	Michelle				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
		Tire Supply Distribution	Stroup					e			
							2				
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	22.95000	137.70	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	23.70000	142.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
100	WRENCH ALLEN HEX KEY	100507	4445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	8.80000	105.60	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	8.50000	102.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
101	PLIERS SLIP JOINT 6 IN	100514	445-52	Pliers, All Kinds (Except Stock Tagging)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000		11/07/2012	7.35000	88.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000		11/12/2012	7.20000	86.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
102	PLIERS SLIP JOINT 8 IN	100515	445-52	Pliers, All Kinds (Except Stock Tagging)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	8.46000	101.52	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	8.30000	99.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
103	PLIERS SLIP JOINT 10 IN	100516	445-52	Pliers, All Kinds (Except Stock Tagging)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	11.00000	132.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	10.80000	129.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
104	PLIERS VICE GRIP 10 IN	100517	445-52	Pliers, All Kinds (Except Stock Tagging)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000		11/07/2012	8.80000	211.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000		11/12/2012	5.70000	136.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
105	RAKE GARDEN BOW 14 TOOTH	100520	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	60.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply	Michelle Stroup				60.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
----------	------------------	---------------	---------	--------	------------------------------	----------------	----------	------------------------	------------	----------------	----------------

Distribution											
840	1	RAKE POTATO 4 TINE	MILLWO DAN RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	3980			60.0000	11/07/2012	7.70000	462.00	
964	1		Hagemeyer Reid Ryan	2868			60.0000	11/12/2012	11.00000	660.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
--------	------	------	----------------	-----------------------	----------	-----	-------------	--------	----------------------

106	RAKE POTATO 4 TINE	100521	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	36.0000	EA	PO	Open	
-----	--------------------	--------	--------	--	---------	----	----	------	--

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
----------	------------------	---------------	---------	--------	------------------------------	----------------	----------	------------------------	------------	----------------	----------------

131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				36.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	RAKE POTATO 4 TINE	MILLWO DAN RKS & DAVENPORT SUPPLY INC	3980			36.0000	11/07/2012	23.65000	851.40	
964	1		Hagemeyer Reid Ryan	2868			36.0000	11/12/2012	25.20000	907.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
107	RAKE ASPHALT 14 TEETH	100522	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000		11/07/2012	46.98000	563.76	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000		11/12/2012	48.70000	584.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
108	RAKE LAWN	100523	445-43	Hoes, Leaf Loaders, Rakes, Council Tools, Weed Cutters, etc.	400.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers	Michelle				400.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
		Tire Supply Distribution	Stroup					e			
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			400.0000	11/07/2012	9.70000	3,880.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			400.0000	11/12/2012	15.70000	6,280.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
109	SAW HACK FRAME 12 POINT	100528	445-58	Saws (Non-Powered): Hack, Keyhole, Pruning, Pole, etc.	36.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				36.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			36.0000	11/07/2012	17.70000	637.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			36.0000	11/12/2012	16.00000	576.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
110	SAW HAND 10 POINT	100529	445-58	Saws (Non-Powered): Hack, Keyhole, Pruning, Pole, etc.	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000		11/12/2012	5.90000	70.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
111	SCRAPPER SIDEWALK	100530	445-63	Scrapers, Ice and Snow (See Class 765 For Motorized Type)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	20.15000	120.90	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	19.00000	114.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
112	SCREWDRI VER STD 4 IN X 1/4	100531	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	4.78000	57.36	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	4.80000	57.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
113	SCREWDRI VER STD 6 IN X 5/16	100532	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000		11/07/2012	5.74000	137.76	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000		11/12/2012	6.30000	151.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
114	SCREWDRI VER STD 8 IN X 3/8	100533	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	60.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				60.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			60.0000	11/07/2012	7.10000	426.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			60.0000	11/12/2012	6.80000	408.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
115	SCREWDRIVER CAB 3 IN X 3/16	100534	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	4.30000	25.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	3.70000	22.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
116	SCREWDRI VER CAB 6 IN X 3/16	100535	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPOR T	3980			6.0000		11/07/2012	5.00000	30.00	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000		11/12/2012	4.00000	24.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
117	SCREWDRI VER CRES 10 IN X 3/16	100536	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	on MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	6.10000	36.60	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	4.50000	27.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
118	SCREWDRIVER PHILLIP NO 1 3 IN	100537	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	3.60000	21.60	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	4.30000	25.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
119	SCREWDRI VER PHILLIP NO 2 4 IN	100538	445-64	Screwdrivers, All Kinds	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPOR T	3980			24.0000	11/07/2012	4.26000	102.24	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	4.80000	115.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
120	PIPE CUTTER 4 WHEEL	100539	670-15	Hand Tools (Not Otherwise Classified)	4.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi	Michelle Stroup				4.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	on MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			4.0000	11/07/2012	157.00000	628.00	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			4.0000	11/12/2012	154.30000	617.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
121	PIPE CUTTER 1 WHEEL	100540	670-15	Hand Tools (Not Otherwise Classified)	4.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				4.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			4.0000	11/07/2012	137.00000	548.00	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			4.0000	11/12/2012	8.50000	34.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
122	WHEEL CUTTER RIDGID 1 TO 2 IN	100541	670-15	Hand Tools (Not Otherwise Classified)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000		11/07/2012	7.65000	91.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000		11/12/2012	136.60000	1,639.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
123	WRENCH RIDGID 8 IN	100542	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	on MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPOR T	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	15.50000	93.00	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	15.60000	93.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
124	WRENCH RIDGID 10 IN	100543	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPOR T	3980			24.0000	11/07/2012	20.40000	489.60	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	20.70000	496.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
125	WRENCH RIDGID E-10 IN	100544	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000		11/07/2012	23.80000	571.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000		11/12/2012	24.70000	592.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
126	WRENCH RIDGID 14 IN STRAIGHT	100545	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	on MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	26.60000	319.20	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	26.70000	320.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
127	WRENCH RIDGID E- 14 IN END	100546	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	on MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	31.65000	379.80	
964	1	Hagemey er	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	32.80000	393.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
128	WRENCH RIDGID 18 IN	100547	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY T INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	38.10000	228.60	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	38.60000	231.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
129	WRENCH RIDGID 24 IN	100548	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	2.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				2.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			2.0000	11/07/2012	61.99000	123.98	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			2.0000	11/12/2012	61.10000	122.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
130	SHOVEL ROUND POINT	100550	445-61	Scoops, Shovels, Spades, Spading Forks, etc. (Including Entr	200.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				200.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			200.0000	11/07/2012	20.05000	4,010.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			200.0000	11/12/2012	20.80000	4,160.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
131	SHOVEL SQUARE POINT	100551	445-61	Scoops, Shovels, Spades, Spading Forks, etc. (Including Entr	200.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup					200.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKES & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT		3980			200.0000		11/07/2012	20.000000	4,000.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan		2868			200.0000		11/12/2012	20.800000	4,160.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
132	SHOVEL LONG HANDLE SCOOP #6	100552	445-61	Scoops, Shovels, Spades, Spading Forks, etc. (Including Entr	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply	Michelle Stroup					6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	Distribution MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	28.70000	172.20	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	29.70000	178.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
133	SNIPS TIN 10 IN	100553	445-70	Snips: Metal, Tin, etc.	4.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributi on	Michelle Stroup				4.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENP T	3980			4.0000	11/07/2012	18.26000	73.04	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			4.0000	11/12/2012	14.90000	59.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
134	TOOL BOX 7X7X19	100558	445-79	Tool Boxes, Cabinets, and Chests (For Truck Tool Compartment	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			24.0000	11/07/2012	74.50000	1,788.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	78.70000	1,888.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
135	WRENCH BOX END 1/2 X 7/16	100565	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Supplier Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
Distribution											
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	11.30000	67.80	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	11.50000	69.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
136	WRENCH BOX END 1/2 X 9/16	100566	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	6.44000	77.28	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	11.80000	141.60	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
137	WRENCH BOX END 3/4 X 7/8	100567	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWOKES & SUPPLY T INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000		11/07/2012	15.45000	92.70	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000		11/12/2012	15.70000	94.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
138	WRENCH BOX END 5/8 X 9/16	100568	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			12.0000	11/07/2012	7.75000	93.00	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	12.70000	152.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
139	WRENCH BOX END 5/8 X 11/16	100569	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000	11/07/2012	12.64000	75.84	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	12.50000	75.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
140	WRENCH BOX END 3/8 X 7/16	100570	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		
840	1	MILLWO RKS & SUPPLY INC	DAN DAVENPORT	3980			6.0000		11/07/2012	10.32000	61.92	
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000		11/12/2012	10.50000	63.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
141	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 6 IN	100571	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	UOM	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000		11/07/2012	NO BID		

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	9.10000	109.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
142	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 8 IN	100572	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	10.20000	244.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
143	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 10 IN	100573	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	11.30000	271.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
144	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 12 IN	100574	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	18.10000	434.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
145	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 15 IN	100575	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	31.80000	190.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
146	WRENCH CRESCENT ADJ 18 IN	100576	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	59.00000	354.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
147	RATCHET 1/2 SQUARE REVERSIBLE	100578	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	24.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				24.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			24.0000	11/12/2012	34.70000	832.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
148	EXTENTIO N 1/2 SQ DR X 5 1/2 IN	100579	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	7.90000	47.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
149	EXTENTIO N 1/2 SQ DR 10 IN	100580	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	10.20000	61.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
150	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 7/16	100581	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	3.80000	22.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
151	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 1/2	100582	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	3.80000	22.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
152	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 9/16	100583	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	3.90000	23.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
153	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 5/8	100584	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	3.90000	23.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
154	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 3/4	100585	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	4.40000	26.40	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
155	SOCKET 1/2 SQ DR X 7/8	100586	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	5.00000	30.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
156	WRENCH OPEN END 3/8 X 7/16	100588	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	5.50000	33.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
157	WRENCH OPEN END 1/2 X 7/16	100589	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	5.70000	34.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
158	WRENCH OPEN END 1/2 X 9/16	100590	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distributor	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	6.30000	37.80	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
159	WRENCH OPEN END 9/16 X 5/8	100591	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	6.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				6.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			6.0000	11/12/2012	7.70000	46.20	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
160	WRENCH OPEN END 5/8 X 3/4	100592	445-91	Wrenches, All Kinds (Including Sockets)	12.0000	EA	PO	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Purchase Order	Quantity	Delivery Date Override	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
131	1	Myers Tire Supply Distribution	Michelle Stroup				12.0000	11/07/2012	NO BID		
964	1	Hagemeyer	Reid Ryan	2868			12.0000	11/12/2012	8.70000	104.40	