
Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

1 AUTOMATI
C
TRANSFER
SWITCH

LS 16 -
AUXILLARY
POWER
SYSTEM

690 POWER
GENERATION
EQUIPMENT,
ACCESSORIES,
AND SUPPLIES

1.0000 EA PO Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        492 1 Cummins
Power
South
LLC

John Carper      2125 1.0000 09/10/201
3

22826.100
00

22,826.10

        518 1 Pro Power
Solutions

Joel
Nettesheim

     4428 1.0000 09/10/201
3

41380.600
00

41,380.60

        2965 1 Mayer
Electric
Suppy

Russ Williams      3827 1.0000 09/10/201
3

23050.000
00

23,050.00

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

2 GENERATO
R SET
W/WEATHE
R RESIST

LS 16 -
AUXILLARY
POWER
SYSTEM

690 POWER
GENERATION
EQUIPMENT,
ACCESSORIES,
AND SUPPLIES

1.0000 EA PO Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        492 1 Cummins
Power
South

John Carper      2125 1.0000 09/10/201
3

3616.6700
0

3,616.67
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Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

LLC

        518 1 Pro Power
Solutions

Joel
Nettesheim

     4428 09/10/201
3

NO BID

        2965 1 Mayer
Electric
Suppy

Russ Williams      3827 09/10/201
3

NO BID

Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

3 SKID BASE
FUEL
STORAGE
TANK

LS 16 -
AUXILLARY
POWER
SYSTEM

690 POWER
GENERATION
EQUIPMENT,
ACCESSORIES,
AND SUPPLIES

1.0000 EA PO Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        492 1 Cummins
Power
South
LLC

John Carper      2125 1.0000 09/10/201
3

2552.1900
0

2,552.19

        518 1 Pro Power
Solutions

Joel
Nettesheim

     4428 09/10/201
3

NO BID

        2965 1 Mayer
Electric
Suppy

Russ Williams      3827 1.0000 09/10/201
3

6383.0000
0

6,383.00
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Event Lines

Line # Name Item Commodity
Code

Commodity
Description

Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Quantity

4 START UP
&
COMMISSI
ONING

LS 16 -
AUXILLARY
POWER
SYSTEM

690 POWER
GENERATION
EQUIPMENT,
ACCESSORIES,
AND SUPPLIES

1.0000 EA PO Open

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier Supplier
Contact

Supplier
Name

Contact Vendor Performanc
e Evaluation

Score

Purchas
e Order

Quantity Delivery
Date
Overrid
e

Unit Price Extended
Price

Award
Quantity

        492 1 Cummins
Power
South
LLC

John Carper      2125 1.0000 09/10/201
3

2668.2500
0

2,668.25

        518 1 Pro Power
Solutions

Joel
Nettesheim

     4428 1.0000 09/10/201
3

1100.0000
0

1,100.00

        2965 1 Mayer
Electric
Suppy

Russ Williams      3827 1.0000 09/10/201
3

NO BID
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