Event Lines

Line# Name Item Commodity Commodity Quantity UoM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
1 SBA 400A BREAKERS 765-06 Breaker/Drill, 1.0000 EA PO Open
Draw Out Gasoline
600V Powered
(Recond
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
778 1 White Len Schlauch 5601 1.0000 03/01/201 41530.000 41,530.00
Electrical 3 00
Constructi
on
1117 1 CED, Inc. Tim Smith 2055 1.0000 03/01/201 NO BID
3
Event Lines
Line# Name Item Commaodity Commaodity Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
2 SBA 800A BREAKERS 765-06 Breaker/Drill, 1.0000 EA PO Open
Draw Out Gasoline
600V Powered
(Recond
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
778 1 White Len Schlauch 5601 1.0000 03/01/201 29791.000 29,791.00
Electrical 3 00
Constructi
on
1117 1 CED, Inc. Tim Smith 2055 1.0000 03/01/201 NO BID
3
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Event Lines

Line# Name Item Commodity Commodity Quantity UoM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
3 SBS3200A BREAKERS 765-06 Breaker/Drill, 1.0000 EA PO Open
Draw Out Gasoline
600V (New) Powered
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation e Order Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
778 1 White Len Schlauch 5601 1.0000 03/01/201 26161.000 26,161.00
Electrical 3 00
Constructi
on
1117 1 CED, Inc. Tim Smith 2055 1.0000 03/01/201 NO BID
3
Event Lines
Line# Name Item Commaodity Commaodity Quantity UOM Output Type Status Total Award
Code Description Quantity
4 SBS4000A BREAKERS 765-06 Breaker/Drill, 1.0000 EA PO Open
Draw Out Gasoline
600V (New) Powered
Line Responses By Supplier
Supplier Supplier Supplier Contact Vendor Performanc Purchas Quantity Delivery Unit Price Extended Award
Contact Name e Evaluation eOrder Date Price Quantity
Score Overrid
e
778 1 White Len Schlauch 5601 1.0000 03/01/201 26161.000 26,161.00
Electrical 3 00
Constructi
on
1117 1 CED, Inc. Tim Smith 2055 1.0000 03/01/201 NO BID
3
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