

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
1	12 X 18 No Parking - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	400.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		400.0000	2.59000	1,036.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		400.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			400.0000	2.81000	1,124.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		400.0000	2.33000	932.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			400.0000	3.94000	1,576.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			400.0000	4.02000	1,608.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			400.0000	2.59000	1,036.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
2	18 X 18 Yellow - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	100.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		100.0000	4.04000	404.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		100.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			100.0000	4.21000	421.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		100.0000	3.49000	349.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			100.0000	6.23000	623.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			100.0000	5.45000	545.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			100.0000	4.04000	404.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
3	18 x 24 W1-8 - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	200.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		200.0000	4.93000	986.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		200.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			200.0000	5.61000	1,122.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		200.0000	4.65000	930.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnina Fann			200.0000	7.89000	1,578.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			200.0000	6.93000	1,386.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			200.0000	4.93000	986.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
4	36 x 12 One-Way - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	400.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		400.0000	4.93000	1,972.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		400.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			400.0000	5.61000	2,244.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		400.0000	4.65000	1,860.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			400.0000	7.89000	3,156.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			400.0000	6.93000	2,772.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			400.0000	4.93000	1,972.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
5	36" Yield - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	50.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		50.0000	6.73000	336.50	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		50.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			50.0000	7.68000	384.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		50.0000	6.45000	322.50	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			50.0000	10.91000	545.50	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			50.0000	9.01000	450.50	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			50.0000	6.73000	336.50	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
6	18 x 30 - Crosswalk Arrow - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	100.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		100.0000	6.15000	615.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		100.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			100.0000	7.01000	701.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		100.0000	5.81000	581.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			100.0000	9.86000	986.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			100.0000	8.66000	866.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			100.0000	6.15000	615.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
7	24 x 24 No Truck - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	100.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		100.0000	7.22000	722.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		100.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			100.0000	7.48000	748.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		100.0000	6.47000	647.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			100.0000	10.52000	1,052.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			100.0000	9.24000	924.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION	HEIDI MCGEE			100.0000	7.22000	722.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
8	24 x 30 White - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	400.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		400.0000	8.18000	3,272.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		400.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			400.0000	9.35000	3,740.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		400.0000	7.75000	3,100.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			400.0000	13.15000	5,260.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			400.0000	11.55000	4,620.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			400.0000	8.18000	3,272.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
9	30 x 30 White - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	400.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		400.0000	10.31000	4,124.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		400.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			400.0000	11.69000	4,676.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		400.0000	9.69000	3,876.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann			400.0000	16.43000	6,572.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			400.0000	14.44000	5,776.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			400.0000	10.31000	4,124.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
10	30" Stop - High Intensity Sign Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	500.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		500.0000	9.93000	4,965.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		500.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			500.0000	11.69000	5,845.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		500.0000	9.69000	4,845.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			500.0000	16.43000	8,215.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			500.0000	14.44000	7,220.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			500.0000	9.93000	4,965.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
11	36" Stop - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	100.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		100.0000	13.43000	1,343.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		100.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			100.0000	16.83000	1,683.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		100.0000	13.95000	1,395.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			100.0000	23.67000	2,367.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			100.0000	20.79000	2,079.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION	HEIDI MCGEE			100.0000	13.43000	1,343.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
12	30x30 Pedestrian Crossing - High Intensity Face	TRAFFIC SIGN FACE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	100.0000	EA	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		100.0000	22.93000	2,293.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		100.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			100.0000	11.69000	1,169.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		100.0000	23.07000	2,307.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann			100.0000	16.43000	1,643.00	
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			100.0000	35.06000	3,506.00	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			100.0000	22.93000	2,293.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris				NO BID		

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
13	6" x 50 Yds White - High Intensity Sheeting	HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	20.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		20.0000	102.44000	2,048.80	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		20.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			20.0000	101.25000	2,025.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		20.0000	96.00000	1,920.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			20.0000	103.72000	2,074.40	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			20.0000	102.44000	2,048.80	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			20.0000	123.75000	2,475.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
14	9" x 50 Yds White - High Intensity Sheeting	HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	153.66000	1,536.60	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	151.88000	1,518.80	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	144.00000	1,440.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	155.59000	1,555.90	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	153.66000	1,536.60	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	185.63000	1,856.30	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
15	30" x 50 Yds White - High Intensity Sheeting	HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	15.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		15.0000	512.19000	7,682.85	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		15.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			15.0000	506.25000	7,593.75	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		15.0000	480.00000	7,200.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			15.0000	518.62000	7,779.30	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			15.0000	512.19000	7,682.85	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			15.0000	618.75000	9,281.25	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
16	30" x 50 Yds Yellow - High Intensity Sheeting	HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	6.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		6.0000	512.19000	3,073.14	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		6.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			6.0000	506.25000	3,037.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		6.0000	480.00000	2,880.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			6.0000	518.62000	3,111.72	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			6.0000	512.19000	3,073.14	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			6.0000	618.75000	3,712.50	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
17	30" x 50 Yds Orange - High Intensity Sheeting	HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	2.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		2.0000	512.19000	1,024.38	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		2.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			2.0000	506.25000	1,012.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		2.0000	480.00000	960.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			2.0000	518.62000	1,037.24	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			2.0000	512.19000	1,024.38	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			2.0000	618.75000	1,237.50	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
18	30" x 50 Yds 3M #1177 Green - ElectroCut Film	ELECTROCUT FILM	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	407.26000	4,072.60	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	393.75000	3,937.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	405.00000	4,050.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	402.93000	4,029.30	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	407.26000	4,072.60	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	517.50000	5,175.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
19	30" x 50 yds 3M #1178 Black - ElectroCut Film	ELECTROCUT FILM	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	6.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		6.0000	407.26000	2,443.56	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		6.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			6.0000	393.75000	2,362.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		6.0000	405.00000	2,430.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			6.0000	402.93000	2,417.58	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			6.0000	407.26000	2,443.56	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			6.0000	517.50000	3,105.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
20	30" x 50 Yds 3M #1172 Red - ElectroCut Film	ELECTROCUT FILM	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	5.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		5.0000	407.26000	2,036.30	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		5.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			5.0000	393.75000	1,968.75	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		5.0000	405.00000	2,025.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Romnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			5.0000	402.93000	2,014.65	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			5.0000	407.26000	2,036.30	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			5.0000	517.50000	2,587.50	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
21	30" x 50 Yds 3M #1175 Blue - ElectroCut Film	ELECTROCUT FILM	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	1.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		1.0000	407.26000	407.26	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		1.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			1.0000	393.75000	393.75	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		1.0000	405.00000	405.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			1.0000	402.93000	402.93	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			1.0000	407.26000	407.26	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			1.0000	517.50000	517.50	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
22	30" x 50 Yds Yellow - ElectroCut Film	ELECTROCUT FILM	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	1.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		1.0000	407.26000	407.26	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		1.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			1.0000	393.75000	393.75	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		1.0000	405.00000	405.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			1.0000	402.93000	402.93	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			1.0000	407.26000	407.26	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			1.0000	517.50000	517.50	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
23	TPM5 Transfer Tape 6" x 100 Yds	TRANSFER TAPE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	60.00000	600.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	56.25000	562.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	52.80000	528.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	50.55000	505.50	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	60.00000	600.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	54.00000	540.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
24	TPM5 Transfer Tape 9" x 100 Yds	TRANSFER TAPE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	90.00000	900.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	84.38000	843.80	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	79.20000	792.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	75.83000	758.30	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	90.00000	900.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	81.00000	810.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
25	TPM5 Transfer Tape 24" x 100 Yds	TRANSFER TAPE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	240.00000	2,400.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	225.00000	2,250.00	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	211.20000	2,112.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnica Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	202.21000	2,022.10	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORAT ION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	240.00000	2,400.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	216.00000	2,160.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
26	TPM5 Transfer Tape 30" x 100 Yds	TRANSFER TAPE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	3.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation	Heidi McGee	5721		3.0000	300.00000	900.00	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		3.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			3.0000	281.25000	843.75	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		3.0000	264.00000	792.00	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			3.0000	252.77000	758.31	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION	HEIDI MCGEE			3.0000	300.00000	900.00	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			3.0000	270.00000	810.00	

Event Lines

Line #	Name	Item	Commodity Code	Commodity Description	Quantity	UOM	Output Type	Status	Total Award Quantity
27	6" x 50 yds Orange/White work zone sheeting	TRANSFER TAPE	801	SIGNS, SIGN MATERIALS, SIGN MAKING EQUIPMENT, AND RELATED SU	10.0000	RL	No Output	Open	

Line Responses By Supplier

Supplier	Supplier Contact	Supplier Name	Contact	Vendor	Performance Evaluation Score	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Award Quantity
734	1	McCain Sales of Florida, Inc.	Mary Bender	5455					
767	1	custom products corporation Proforma PrintSource	Heidi McGee	5721		10.0000	112.05000	1,120.50	
956	1	Proforma PrintSource	Dan Mack	4434		10.0000	NO BID		
1568	1	Rocal, Inc	Teri Sellers			10.0000	74.25000	742.50	
1570	1	Vulcan Inc.	J. Todd Koniar	7759		10.0000	79.17000	791.70	
2513	1	Georgia Correctional Industrie	Ronnia Fann				NO BID		
2606	1	Safeway Sign Company	Vickie Hanson			10.0000	76.86000	768.60	
2623	1	CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION	HEIDI MCGEE			10.0000	112.05000	1,120.50	
2697	1	3M Company	John Morris			10.0000	77.25000	772.50	