
Bid Title:
Event Number:

MWBEGoal:
Bid Opening Date:

Buyer:
   Dept. Personnel:

Items Qty Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 1000 Short Sleeve Shirts 30.95$                 30,950.00$        No Bid -$                     
2 750 Long Sleeve Shirts 32.00$                 24,000.00$        No Bid -$                     
3 45 Oxford Shirts 14.00$                 630.00$             No Bid -$                     
4 100 Navy Cap 33.75$                 3,375.00$          No Bid -$                     
5 25 White Cap 37.50$                 937.50$             No Bid -$                     
6 75 Work Jacket 79.35$                 5,951.25$          No Bid -$                     
7 1000 Work Trousers 33.20$                 33,200.00$        No Bid -$                     
8 100 Dress Trousers 27.85$                 2,785.00$          No Bid -$                     
9 50 Clip on Ties 2.90$                   145.00$             No Bid -$                     
10 25 Dress Shoe 67.80$                 1,695.00$          79.91$                   1,997.75$            
11 125 Safety Toe Work Shoe 89.70$                 11,212.50$        98.12$                   12,265.00$          
12 150 Safety Toe Work Boots 70.80$                 10,620.00$        74.92$                   11,238.00$          
13 250 Safety Toe "kick off" Shoe 79.35$                 19,837.50$        93.56$                   23,390.00$          
14 300 Polo Shirts 31.90$                 9,570.00$          -$                     

Total: 154,908.75$      48,890.75$          
Discount:   
Net Total:  

 

GT Distributors of GA, Inc.

 

Athens, GA  30606

Keeprs, Inc.
Fire Department Uniforms Vendor: Vendor:

23-Oct-12
100 McFarland Avenue
Rossville, GA  30741

(800) 241-8950(706) 549-3434

110-B Athens West Parkway

Chief Cedric Scott - Fire Dept.

Event No. 748
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Bid Title:
Event Number:

MWBEGoal:
Bid Opening Date:

Buyer:
   Dept. Personnel:

Items Qty Description
1 1000 Short Sleeve Shirts
2 750 Long Sleeve Shirts
3 45 Oxford Shirts
4 100 Navy Cap
5 25 White Cap
6 75 Work Jacket
7 1000 Work Trousers
8 100 Dress Trousers
9 50 Clip on Ties
10 25 Dress Shoe
11 125 Safety Toe Work Shoe
12 150 Safety Toe Work Boots
13 250 Safety Toe "kick off" Shoe
14 300 Polo Shirts

Total:
Discount:
Net Total:

Fire Department Uniforms

23-Oct-12

Chief Cedric Scott - Fire Dept.

Event No. 748

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
No Bid -$                     29.90$                    29,900.00$        
No Bid -$                     33.80$                    25,350.00$        
No Bid -$                     24.00$                    1,080.00$          
38.57 3,857.00$            42.00$                    4,200.00$          

44.00$                   1,100.00$            47.00$                    1,175.00$          
111.77$                 8,382.75$            92.00$                    6,900.00$          
32.14$                   32,140.00$          37.00$                    37,000.00$        
34.19$                   3,419.00$            34.00$                    3,400.00$          
2.95$                     147.50$               5.50$                      275.00$             

75.33$                   1,883.25$            78.47$                    1,961.75$          
104.00$                 13,000.00$          108.00$                  13,500.00$        
78.67$                   11,800.50$          86.00$                    12,900.00$        
95.33$                   23,832.50$          75.50$                    18,875.00$        
42.86$                   12,858.00$          32.00$                    9,600.00$          

112,420.50$        166,116.75$      
 

Vendor: Vendor:
NAFECO

 
(800) 876-4242

Lexington, KY  40505

Galls, LLC
1340 Russell Cave Road6215 Regency Parkway

Norcross, GA  30071
(770) 248-0049
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